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An overall trend in education is moving the content on-line and using more technology tools rather 
than books and classroom training. We see the technological shift with the introduction of Mobile 
Learning, Virtual Reality and Augmented Reality training.   

IDT Trend in K-12 to Business and Industry 

My career has focused on the Business and Industry trend of Instructional Design, but I believe that 
the K-12 trends are more important to understand than the trends of the Business and Industry 
educational environment. The K-12 trends are the foundation of tomorrow’s workforce. Within 10 
years, there will be a new workforce to train, and we need to follow the K-12 educational trends to 
recruit, empower and train the next generation workforce.  

In educational settings, an advantage to using Virtual Reality (VR) or Augmented Reality (AR) 
training is the ability to have safe experiments. Teachers would no longer have to provide animals to 
dissect or expensive materials for chemical experiments. The experiments could all be completed 
using augmented reality in a safe classroom setting. The school would have a material savings, over 
time, and students would improve their digital fluency by using technology in a safe science based 
educational setting.  

As listed in Trends and issues in instructional design and technology, the use of VR and AR in 
Vocational Education is discussed. The simulation of highly technical task is utilized in Germany, just 
as it is currently used in the US1.  

There is also a more recent study discussing the usage of VR in education and technical training. 
Teachers were interviewed and confirmed “teachers expect VR to enrich classes through interactive 
engagement in situations that would otherwise be too costly or dangerous.”2 Very similar to the use 
of VR and AR in German Vocational Education & Training.  

The ability to use augmented reality in a training setting by allowing the student to walk through a 
real-life scenario in a safe environment, is how the US and globally could use wearable technology. 
In highly technical training programs augmented reality can be used for the student to visualize and 
walk through of an actual technical task in a safe environment. Students can safely make mistakes in 
the augmented training before encountering a real-life scenario. The student ultimately feels 
empowered and confident in technical tasks while also improving digital fluency.  

Overall the resources provide a clear understanding of how VR and AR are used globally and in the 
US. VR and AR used to be concepts and ideas only seen in a futuristic version of education and 
training. The development of VR apps, instruction design programs focused on the development of 
VR and AR programs, and the use of VR and AR in entertainment and gaming. It is no longer an 
inaccessible tool but becoming inexpensive and easy to use in an educational and training 
environment.  
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